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Senior Stewards Report 
 

Name of Track Woodbine  

Date November 10, 2023 Post-time 1:05pm 

Weather Clear 9c   Wind  W 12 kph  

Track Conditions  Type: Tapeta Turf: N/A 

Number of Races 9   83 entered  

Scratches         Vet: 3 Stewards: 2 Track:   

 

Senior Steward Associate Steward Associate Steward 

Gunnar Lindberg Fenton Platts Tom Miller / Jason Portuondo 

 
Report on day’s Events: (Backstretch - accidents, fines, suspensions, objections, disqualifications, refunds, pertinent incidents, 

general details etc., Film Reviews, Races, Claims) 

 

Office:  

 
 

Film Reviews: 

 

Races: 

Race 1 – Clear 
 
Race 2 – Clear 
 
Race 3 - #6 “Ladies Rum” ridden by Jose Campos was fractious in the gate and scratched by the 
official Veterinarian. #1 “Virginia’s Legacy” ridden by Skye Chernetz was slow leaving there and 
never in contention throughout. Mutuel refund on #6 was $52,241. 
 
Race 4 – Jockey Claim of Foul by riders Leo Salles aboard #5 “Silent Lucidity” and Fraser Aebly 
aboard #6 “Chelsea Dagger” against #7 “Rockland Express” ridden by Kazushi Kimura for 
interference through the stretch. Kazushi said I was well clear of the two, may have come in a bit 
but was clear, inside horse came out. Fraser said he thought the #7 came in but now realizes he 
went out with his own horse more than he thought. Leo said both the #6 bore out and #7 came in, 

  



he was caught in between and it cost him a position. After review, the Claims of Foul were 
disallowed.  
 
Video review: https://youtu.be/amh8Ul9XRr8  
 
Race 5 – Stewards Inquiry and Trainer Claim of Foul (COF) by Santino Depaola of #8 “Hey Luigi” 
along with the rider Alexander Marti. Second COF by Jockey Jodeien Anderson aboard #6 
“Phantom Jewel” against #7 “Rock Bullet” with Kazushi Kimura aboard. Kazushi said his horse 
did go in with him and up against #6 through the stretch, grabbed as quick as I could. Jodeien 
said the outside horse #7, did come over on him and push him down into the inside horses, had 
trouble getting his horse off those inside. Alexander Marti said the outside horses came down and 
squeezed him, the inside horses pushed back and Marti had to check and and get out of there. 
Ryan Munger said he had to hold his ground best he could because the pressure from the 
outside was going to push him onto the heels of the eventual winner, nothing more I could do. 
After review, it appeared the #7 with Kazushi did come in and the result was the four inside him 
were stacked up. #7 was disqualified from second and placed sixth behind #8.  
 
Video review: https://youtu.be/K45hMa1yHi4  
 
Race 6 – Stewards Inquiry and Rider Claim of Foul (COF) by Amanda Vandermeersch aboard 
#10 “Good Soldier” against #9 “ Kazushi Kimura for interference through the stretch. Amanda 
said the #9 came down in front of me and I caught that one’s heels, however, now that I see the 
video, it is apparent the inside horses came out and put me across Kazushi’s heels. Kazushi said 
he stayed as straight as possible, wind is strong but I stayed out. We spoke with Sahin Civaci 
aboard #7 “Twixter” who said his horse was getting out with him and did go out through the 
stretch, my horse was shying from the #3 to my inside, did my best to keep straight. After review, 
it is apparent the #7 did go out through the stretch, pushing horses out which created the situation 
for Amanda and her catching heels of the #9. A second COF was lodged by Justin Stein aboard 
#1 “Chairman Layla” against #4 “Social Justice” ridden by Ryan Munger for interference through 
the stretch. Jus https://youtu.be/Jb-z43jYJVstin said that as Ryan was going by me he came over 
into my path, I could see Ryan was doing his best but his horse was not responding. Ryan said 
his horse was laying in with him but thought he was clear of Justin. After review, the second COF 
was disallowed.  
 
Video review: https://youtu.be/Jb-z43jYJVs  
 
Race 7 – Lake Ontario Stakes – Clear 
 
Race 8 – Ashbridges Bay Stakes – Clear 
 
Race 9 – Stewards Inquiry into the start regarding #2 “Autumn’s So Flashy” ridden by Alexis 
Sanchez who was unseated shortly after the start. No change 
 
Mutuel handle $3,945,374 
 

Claims: 

Race 2 – #7 “Roses Are Free” goes to owners Eric Ross & Steven Chircop for $7,500. Trainer 
Steven Chircop.  
 
Race 3 - #5 “Hyper Holiday” goes to owner/trainer Devon Gittens for $15,000.  
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