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Senior Judges Report 
 

Name of Track      Kawartha Downs Fraserville 

Date     Saturday, 22 Sep 2018 Post Time 19:00 

Weather   Race 1 - 10: Clear (Temp: 15 deg. C) 

Track Condition Race 1 - 10: Fast (Variant 1 secs)   

Number of Races 10 Qualifying races  2 BF Total Entries  77/82 

Mutual Handle $34,081 

Contact  
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Visit 
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Judge Update 

  

 

Senior Judge Associate Judge Associate Judge 

Weber, Michael Coles, Sharla Frenette, Ben 

Report on day’s events:  

(Accidents, claims, fines and/or suspensions, objections and/or disqualifications, refunds and any other pertinent incidents)  …. 

Office: 

 Emergency lights and siren are functioning properly after the one week hiatus in 
racing.  

 Reviewed safety regulations and protocols with management relating to public 
and participant safety for the parade horses and starting gate.  

 Review with driver Nick Boyd from 8 September race 8 regarding his urging of 
ROCKET GAL in the stretch; Mr. Boyd was adjudged guilty of violating AGCO 
rules 22.23.01 (b) (excessive) and 22.23.03 (a, b & c) (above head, beyond 90o 
relative to the track and outside the confines of the sulky) and assessed a driving 
suspension of three day (to be served 7-9 October, inclusive) and a monetary 
penalty of $200 (SB 50393).  

 Review with driver Nick Boyd from 8 September race 9 regarding AGCO rule 
22.05.01 (k) (failure to set or maintain a pace comparable to class); the 
explanation of Mr. Boyd was partially accepted and no penalty was assessed.  

Races:  

1. Driver of #1 MAGNIFY BLISS, Jason Woodward, will attend the Judge’s office 
for a review of his urging in the stretch relative to AGCO rules 22.23.03 (a & b) 
(above head and beyond 90o relative to the track). Clear.  

2. Reviewed possible interference after the ¾ mile pole between #2 
EATAAMCLASSICFOX (Clayton Graham) who finished 5th and #3 BLUE 
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MASERATI (Rodney Hughes) who finished 3rd; #2 appears to push #3 three 
wide, Mr. Graham stated he was not “bothered very much” while Mr. Hughes 
stated his horse was green (four lifetime starts) and beared out; no placing 
necessary; Mr. Hughes cautioned regarding causing interference and having 
control of his horse, no penalty. Clear.  

3. Clear.  

4. Clear.  

5. Clear.  

6. Clear.  

7. Inquiry on #2 HONOR ABOVE ALL (Keith Jones) after the ¾ mile pole 
concerning AGCO rule 18.08.02 (leaving the course), #2 hit two consecutive 
pylons but did not leave the course, no violations. Clear.  

8. Breathalyzer retest. Clear. 

9. Inquiry on #3 CASIMIR PATRIOT (Clayton Graham) who broke stretch and 
finish, #3 finished 5th and was placed 6th for failure to continuously lose ground 
while off stride (AGCO rule 22.27). Clear.  

10. Driver of #6 ROAN BRUISER, Stephen Halkes, will attend the Judge’s office 
for a review of his urging in the stretch concerning AGCO rules22.23.01 (b) 
(excessive) and 22.23.03 (a, b & c) (above head, beyond 90o relative to the track 
and outside the confines of the sulky). Clear.  

Claims: None.  

 


